[Extract from Haryana Government Gazette (Extra.), dated the 13th September, 2011]

HARYANA GOVERNMENT
TOWN AND COUNTRY PLANNING DEPARTMENT
Notification
The 13th September, 2011

No. PF-46/13482.—The following draft of the rules further to amend the Haryana
Development and Regulation of Urban Areas Rules, 1976, which the Governor of Haryana proposes
to make in exercise of the powers conferred by Sub-section (1) read with Sub-section (2) of Section 24
of the Haryana Development and Regulation of Urban Areas Act, 1975 (8 of 1975), is hereby published
as required under Sub-section (1) of the said section, for the information of persons likely to be

affected thereby.

Notice is hereby given that the draft of the rules will be taken into consideration by the
Government on or after the expiry of a period of thirty days from the date of publication of this
notification in the Official Gazette, together with objections or suggestions, if any, which may be
received in writing by the Financial commissioner and Principal Secretary to Government, Haryana,
Town and Country Planning Department, Chandigarh, from any person with respect to the draft of

the rules, before the expiry of the period so specified.
DRAFT RULES

1. These rules may be called the Haryana Development and Regulation of Urban Areas
(Amendment) Rules, 2011.

2. In the Haryana Development and Regulation of Urban Areas Rules, 1976 (hereinafter called
the said rules), in rule 3, in sub-rule (1), in clause (a), for the words “at the rates”, the words, figure
and sign “calculated at 25% of the rates” shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been inserted
with effect from the 10th January, 2009.

3. In the said rules, in rule 10, for the words “within a period of thirty days” the words “within a
period of sixty days” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect
from the 10th January, 2009.

4. In the said rules, in rule 11, sub-rule (1), —

(a) in clause (b), for the words “fifty percent”, the words “thirty percent” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 3rd April, 2003;

(b) after clause (g) the following clause shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been

inserted with effect from the 10th January, 2009, namely : —
“(gg) pay balance license fee as determined by Director”;

5. In the said rules, in rule 27, for the words “fifty percentum”, the words “thirty percentum”
shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 3rd April, 2003.

S.S. DHILLON,
Financial Commissioner and Principal Secretary to
Government Haryana, Town and Country Planning Department.



